Registered with the Registrar
of Newspapers for India
under No. 10410

i R
®
UG &ECEM R SigdHD
La Gazette de L' Etat de Poudouchery
The Gazette of Puducherry

PART - 11
Amriy aenelui® EXTRAORDINAIRE EXTRAORDINARY

S Fmrd Qumm Publiée par Published by
Qeuafluf® Autorité Authority
B ygFGaF dwnrpsspmw 2024 @F° saraf i 18 A
No. » 3 Poudouchéry Jeudi 18 Janvier 2024
No. Puducherry Thursday 18th January 2024

(28 Pausa 1945)

GOVERNMENT OF PUDUCHERRY
LABOUR DEPARTMENT

(G.O. Ms. No. 1/AIL/Lab./G/2024,
Puducherry, dated 02nd January 2024)

NOTIFICATION

Whereas, the Draft Rules seeking to amend the Puducherry
Factories Rules, 1964, was issued in the Government of Puducherry,
Labour Department’s Notification under G.O. Ms. No. 06/AIL/Lab/G/2022,
dated 31st May 2022 and published as required under sub-section (1)
of section 115 of the Factories Act, 1948 (Central Act 63 of 1948),

[21]



22 LA GAZETTE DE L'ETAT [PAarT-II

in the Extraordinary Gazette Part -II, No. 31, dated 12th July 2022
of the Government of Puducherry, inviting objections and suggestions,
if any, from all persons likely to be affected thereby;

And whereas, no objection or suggestion has so far been received
from any quarter in this regard;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred under
section 112 of the Factories Act, 1948, the Lieutenant-Governor,
Puducherry, hereby makes the following rules further to amend the
Puducherry Factories Rules, 1964, namely :-

1. Short title and commencement.— (1) These rules may be called
the Puducherry Factories (Amendment) Rules, 2023.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication
in the Official Gazette.

2. Amendment to rule 4.— In the Puducherry Factories Rules, 1964
(hereinafter, referred to as the said rules), in rule 4, for the existing
Schedule thereunder, the following Schedule shall be substituted, namely:



23

LA GAZETTE DE L'ETAT

ParT-II]

. 1o . - a . i |
i ] [ iR ) DON'FEERE | ONOOVESH | DO0'YEER | DOOOFEH | oO0rarTw | OOORETVH | 0OOTITSH | CO0NsTE | oDooESH Loy QOOOT AR08y
5 samog e
D0 BV S 0 P DR | oot | DOOPIESH | G0OWC'TY | 0O0EETSH | o0OTrDE fie it LR 0 P CO0NT D106 Hmog
TEIOH DOEL BNEY
sivead anioy |
O ne0'0eETH CODOEESH | GOOTTE | COUER'TSH | OOO'CRTR | DO0'30°w =g g ] Loceicg ] OHIEF R | OOUEY S TG N Jaead
e DO, A0y
e ]
OO0 OOUOEESE | OOELEH | DOOMETTH | 000'w0rve | ODORSTRH | OOGEFTYH | DO0'0ETH ey | D00ERSH | G0NEE BO0S ©idn samng
SO (T SRy
Jawead auoy
DOT9EE T OO T meOgeeR | OEVET | ooTET Y Pl e e ] FLe )] OOUBKEH ST | ODETISH DT BN 1y
0 WL asogy
LT
DMITUE S D0 TRE OOe TS | G002 v ] 00O TR ooornETy [F g s ] [t L 0 ET [ PR B LR L]
A0 D asogy
Aoy dNTH
OO BT SH O EY | oOODR'ESH | 0TI | eO0METRE | ooDrese [ DEASE T OUarsd | oe0Zeed | o0TiTH DO THEN Il
FEIOH Q%E dRoqy
LU T
QO 3T R [E Ve 1] BOST e | DT | non'veT DE0EL W OO BE T OEEL R [y epa e | [Hiata ] HE"F5H T mdn sasagd
aPH BT Aaogy
o s
[ ] OOOWL'E MWOTETR | 00l | DUBOTTSH | DOOWEY OOFEL S [ ] oL 008 s W [t ase] RTT Sadn Mg
Wb [ ey
Jamng ATy |
[Le (LS BO0'oR TV L g T ] N EE 5 =11 ] ElET R ] O0F ¥ 5H = Tt ] QUK ESH 5 LN g
Gy O] aaoqy
| DTV OO0 B TR L o 'AF e OO0 HL L E ] A DORE [ ] [ !E.“Lﬂ_..l
OOUNE'T s N9 T o' e O O DT E0T 50 [ b OOL°E 'H ok"T "% [ ] OOE SH Hmng LT i
=3y Ly e sy
an L1 | [ ] [ ® 151 | [ [ ] [T}
oot awegy | mo0dT | eosd | menr | ool o0f | osE ot | es 0| & fuawdnb apgai
gl g fupnp bep e uo pakidus ag o3 I AT 1 Py .v:t!ﬁ.__.;.-:_!_.!:ﬂﬂ
«ATNATHIE.



24 LA GAZETTE DE L'ETAT [PAarT-II

3. Amendment to rule 5.— In the said rules, in sub-rule (3)
for the words “fifty rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees” shall be
substituted.

4. Amendment to rule 7.— In the said rules, in sub-rule (2)
for the words “One hundred rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees”
shall be substituted.

5. Amendment to rule 9.— In the said rules, for the words
“one hundred rupees”, the words “two hundred rupees” shall be
substituted.

6. Amendment to rule 105.— In the said rules, in clause (a)
of sub-rule (2-A) for the figures and words “rupees 50 per year per worker”,
the figures and words, “rupees 200 per year per worker” shall be
substituted.

(By order of the Lieutenant-Governor)

P. RAGINI,
Under Secretary to Government (Labour).

online publication at “https://styandptg.py.gov.in”
Published by the Director, Government Press, Puducherry.



